
2019 Preliminary Budget Adjustments
as of 11/13/2018

Budget line Description
2019 
Supervisor

2019 
Adopted Change

A.1355.011 ASSESSOR.PERMANENT STAFF 374,235        375,384     1,149          
A.5010.015 SUPT. OF HIGHWAYS.APPOINTED OFFICIALS 3,000            2,817          (183)            
B.1989.478.16 UNCLASSIFIED.INTERFUND CHARGES POLICE 1,322,135    835,832     (486,303)    
B.1989.478.17 UNCLASSIFIED.INTERFUND CHARGES.OTHER 197,560        683,863     486,303      
B.3120.016.16 POLICE.HOLIDAY PAY.POLICE 160,000        290,000     130,000      
D.5110.011.04 HIGHWAY REPAIR.PERMANENT STAFF.PT 2,470,754    2,485,880  15,126        
D.5110.457.04 HIGHWAY REPAIR. W/OUTSIDE VENDORS.PT 225,000        217,000     (8,000)         
D.5140.011.05 MISC. BRUSH.PERMANENT STAFF.TW 1,316,286    1,242,939  (73,346)      
D.5140.012.05 MISC. BRUSH.TIME & ONE HALF.TW 167,500        127,500     (40,000)      
D.5142.011.05 SNOW REMOVAL.PERMANENT STAFF.TW 438,762        414,313     (24,449)      
D.5140.013.05 MISC. BRUSH.SEASONAL & PART TIME.TW 100,000        125,000     25,000        
D.5142.013.05 SNOW.SEASONAL & PART TIME.TW -                 15,000       15,000        
E.9710.600 SERIAL BOND DEBT SERVICE.BOND PRINCIPAL 96,026          96,574       548             
E.9710.700 SERIAL BOND DEBT SERVICE.BOND INTEREST 26,941          26,409       (532)            
E.7250.457 BLUE HILL.CONTRACTS W/OUTSIDE VENDORS 1,663,119    1,663,103  (16)              
V.9710.600.06 SERIAL BOND DEBT SERVICE.BOND PRINCIPAL 440,565        468,964     28,399        
V.9710.700.06 SERIAL BOND DEBT SERVICE.BOND INTEREST 242,947        215,436     (27,511)      
B.3620.443.17 SAFETY INSPECTION.AGREEMENTS.OTHER 7,000            89,770       82,770        
A.1355.457 ASSESSOR.CONTRACTS W/OUTSIDE VENDORS 6,800            20,200       13,400        
A.5010.457 SUPT. OF HIGHWAYS.CONTRACTS OUTSIDE 12,000          25,400       13,400        
G.8130.457 SEWAGE TREATMENT.CONTRACTS OUTSIDE 140,000        146,700     6,700          
A.7020.457 PARKS & REC ADMIN.CONTRACTS OUTSIDE -                 6,700          6,700          
B.3620.457.17 SAFETY INSPECTION.CONTRACTS OUTSIDE -                 (3,500)        (3,500)         

Total 160,655$   













































1 Review the Mini-Bid responses located on the "Summary" worksheet. This worksheet is a summary of the "Response
Summary" worksheets from each responding Contractor's "Form B (Class 3-8): Mini-Bid Response ," and also includes any
"Late Bid" and "No Bid" responses that were received.

2 Review the "Response Summary" worksheets included in this workbook.  These worksheets are a copy of the "Response
Summary" worksheets from each responding Contractor's "Form B (Class 3-8): Mini-Bid Response," and provide more detail
about the Contractor's response. Include the following in your review:

A. The Mini-Bid Request Number entered by the Contractor in Part A, Question 1.0, matches the Mini-Bid Request Number for
your Mini-Bid.

B. The Contractor Reponse to Question 1.1 on the "Response Summary" worksheet, "Number of Items included in this Mini-
Bid," matches the number of Items that were included in the Mini-Bid.

Note: In order to submit a responsive Mini-Bid response, all requested information for all Items included in the Mini-Bid should
be entered on the applicable "Item" worksheet (see step 3 below). If "Enter Pricing" appears in the "Grand Total Evaluation
Price for Mini-Bid" cell (Cell S39), that indicates that all required pricing information has not been entered by the Contractor on
the applicable "Item" worksheet.  Failure to enter all required pricing information for an Item shall deem the Mini-Bid response
for that Item non-responsive and shall result in the rejection of the Mini-Bid response for the Mini-Bid.

3 Review the detailed responses received from each Contractor to determine if any clarifications or disqualifications are
necessary. These detailed responses were attached to the email from the Vehicle Marketplace team that this workbook was
attached to, and have the following naming convention:  Award#-Mini-Bid#-Contract# (e.g., 22904-T15120001-PC12345). There
should be a detailed response workbook from each Contractor that is listed on the "Summary" worksheet of this workbook.
Include the following in your review:
A. The Contractor completed an "Item" worksheet, with all required information, for each Item included in the Mini-Bid.

B. The Contractor answer on each applicable "Item" worksheet to Part A, Question 2.0, corresponds to the Vehicle Type that
was requested in the Mini-Bid (i.e., Chassis Only, Body Only, Complete Vehicle).

C. The Contractor answered "Yes" to Part A, Question 4.0, "Can the Vehicles offered for the Mini-Bid be delivered by the
delivery date specified?" Per the instructions on Form B, a Mini-Bid response may be deemed non-responsive and be rejected if
the Vehicles cannot be delivered by the delivery date specified.

Note:  A delivery date that is later than the delivery date specified in the Mini-Bid may be considered only if (1) none of the
responding Contractors can meet the delivery date specified in the Mini-Bid, and (2) it was indicated on the Form A (Class 3-8):
Mini-Bid Request for this Mini-Bid, that "if none of the Contractors responding to the Mini-Bid can meet the delivery date
specified," the Authorized User will "consider offers from Contractors that can provide the requested Vehicles at a later date."

D. The summary description of the vehicle(s) offered for the Mini-Bid that the Contractor entered in "Part B: Vehicle(s) Offered
for Mini-Bid" appears to meet the specifications of the Mini-Bid.

E. Any additional information entered by the Contractor in "Part C: Additional Information" does not either disqualify the Mini-Bid
response or provide information that should result in a non-award and reissue of the Mini-Bid.

F. "Part D: Vehicle Request Price Worksheets" has been completed with no apparent errors, with information entered in all
yellow-colored cells in the Chassis Price Worksheet," and "Body Price Worksheet," as applicable, and delivery information
entered in the "Delivery Charge Worksheet" section for all requested Vehicles and delivery locations.

Note: In accordance with the "Definitions and Instructions" in this section, "a Contractor may include a Delivery Charge that is
less than the Delivery Allowance in the bid submitted for the Mini-Bid. A bid that includes a Delivery Charge that exceeds the
Delivery Allowance shall be rejected." Refer to the Delivery Allowance Schedule (DAS) on the "Instructions and Charts"
worksheet for the maximum dollar amount that shall be paid for delivery of a Vehicle from the Delivery Origin to the applicable
Region delivered to.

Group 40500-22904, VEHICLES, Class 3-8

Mini-Bid Response Evaluation and Award Instructions
This Excel workbook provides Authorized Users with Contractor responses that were received for a Class 3-8 Vehicles Mini-Bid
conducted via the Vehicle Marketplace at http://vehicles.nyspro.ogs.ny.gov. The Authorized User is responsible for evaluation and
award of the Mini-Bid. Reserved rights of the Authorized User regarding Mini-Bids are listed below. At a minimum, please follow the
steps below when evaluating and awarding a Mini-Bid:



G. If "No Bid" responses have been submitted by Contractors, review the reason(s) for the "No Bid," and determine if the
reason should result in a non-award and reissue of the Mini-Bid.

4 Request clarification, if necessary, from the Contractors. Contact information is located in Part A of the "Response Summary"
worksheets. Review responses and determine if the clarifications should result in either the disqualification of a Mini-Bid
response, or a change in the information entered in by the Contractor in the Mini-Bid response. A change to pricing information
entered on the "Item" worksheets will result in a change to the Contractor's "Total Evaluation Price for Item" for the applicable
Item and may alter the ranking of the bids included on the "Summary" worksheet of this workbook (Note: The "Summary"
worksheet will not automatically update ).

5 At a minimum, request a Build Sheet and the most recently published OEM Pricelist, (available for Chassis only), and
Contractor-Published Pricelist, as applicable, for each Chassis and Body offered from the responsive Contractor with the
apparent low bid. An Authorized User may request these documents from any or all Contractors that responded to the Mini-Bid.

“Build Sheet” shall refer to the document which lists, at a minimum, (1) The Make, Model and Model Code of the Chassis and/or
Body; and (2) An itemized list of all standard equipment, Options and Aftermarket Components included in the Chassis and/or
Body.

“Contractor-Published Pricelist” shall refer to the electronic, (i.e., in Excel or PDF format), document(s) issued by the Contractor
which lists, among other things, an item number, description and MSRP for the Contractor’s complete Product Line.

“OEM Pricelist” shall refer to the nationally published or internal document(s) issued by the Chassis or Body manufacturer
which lists, among other things, an Option Code, description and MSRP for the OEM’s Product Line.

6 Review the Build Sheet(s) to determine if the Vehicle(s) that the Contractor(s) offered for the Mini-Bid meet the Authorized User
Specifications that were included in the Mini-Bid.

7 Determine the awardee of the Mini-Bid. The only OGS approved method of award is "Lowest price to a single contractor that
can meet the specified delivery date, and supply the total number of Chassis and Bodies requested."

8 Send notification of award/partial award or non-award, or that it was determined that an award will not be made, to all
Contractors who responded to the Mini-Bid. Sample letters may be downloaded from Authorized Buyer section of the Vehicle
Marketplace website at https://vehicles.nyspro.ogs.ny.gov/content/vehicle-buyer-information.

9 If an award was made, issue a Purchase Order to the awarded Contractor, using your standard procedures.

10 Download Form C (Class 3-8): Mini-Bid Report of Use  from Authorized Buyer section of the Vehicle Marketplace website at
https://vehicles.nyspro.ogs.ny.gov/content/vehicle-buyer-information, and follow the directions on that form for completion and
submittal to OGS Procurement Services.

Authorized User Procurement Rights.
Authorized Users hereby reserve the right in a Mini-Bid to:

1 Reject any or all responses received in response to the Mini-Bid;
2 Withdraw the Mini-Bid at any time, at the Agency’s sole discretion;
3 Make an award under the Mini-Bid in whole or in part;
4 Disqualify any Contractor submitting a response whose conduct and/or proposal fails to conform to the requirements of the Mini-
5 Seek clarifications and revisions of Mini-Bid responses;
6 Prior to the Mini-Bid response submittal deadline, amend the solicitation specifications to correct errors or oversights, or to

supply additional information, as it becomes available;
7 Prior to the Mini-Bid response submittal deadline, direct Contractors to submit modifications addressing subsequent Mini-Bid

amendments;
8 Change any of the schedule dates with notification through the Vehicle Marketplace and via email distribution to all Contractors;
9 Eliminate any mandatory, non-material specifications that cannot be complied with by all of the prospective Contractors;

10 Waive any requirements that are not material;
11 Utilize any and all ideas submitted in the Mini-Bid responses received;
12 Adopt all or any part of a Contractor’s Mini-Bid response in selecting the optimum configuration;
13 Negotiate with the Contractor responding to the Mini-Bid within the Mini-Bid requirements to serve the best interests of the

State. This includes requesting clarifications of any or all Contractor’s Mini-Bid responses;
14 Require clarification at any time during the procurement process and/or require correction of arithmetic or other apparent errors

for the purpose of assuring a full and complete understanding of a Contractor’s Mini-Bid response and/or to determine a
Contractor’s compliance with the requirements of the Mini-Bid;

15 Select and award the Mini-Bid to other than the selected Contractor in the event of unsuccessful negotiations (e.g., if it is
determined at the pre-production meeting that the Authorized User Specifications shall need significant adjustments to meet
their Vehicle needs), or, optionally, in other specified circumstances as detailed in the Mini-Bid requirements; and

16 Use information obtained through site visits, management interviews, and the state’s investigation of a Contractor’s
qualifications, experience, ability or financial standing, and any material or information submitted by the Contractor in response
to the agency’s request for clarifying information in the course of evaluation and/or selection under the Mini-Bid.



Group 40500-22904, VEHICLES, Class 3-8; Mini-Bid Response Opening Results
Mini-Bid Number: T18080022

Bidder (#) Mini-Bid # Contractor Contract #
Grand Total Evaluation
Price for Mini-Bid

Response Summary T18080022 Van Bortel Ford, Inc. PC67290 $65,509.62
Response Summary (2) T18080022 Carmody Ford Inc PC67991 $66,823.20

Late Bid (#) Mini-Bid # Contractor Contract # Date/Time Bid Arrived
None

No Bid (#) Mini-Bid # Contractor Contract # Reason for No Bid
None



GROUP 40500-22904 VEHICLES, Class 3-8 (Statewide) Appendix C: #5

Q#
1.0

1.1

2.0
2.1

2.1

2.3

2.4

3.0
3.1

3.2

3.3

3.4

4.0
4.1

4.2

4.3

4.4 Contact Phone (2)

Part B: Mini-Bid Response Summary

Contact Phone (1) 585-586-7705

Contact Email jrelyea@vanbortelford.com
Contact Phone (1) 585-586-7705

Contact Phone (2)

Secondary Contact Information
Contact Name Maria Opaczewski

Contact Email fleet@vanbortelford.com

Contact Name Josh Relyea

Number of Items included in this Mini-Bid (see Form A (Class 3-8):
Mini-Bid Request for number of Items, click on yellow cell and use drop-
down menu)

1

Business Information
Full Legal Business Name, including DBA if applicable Van Bortel Ford, Inc.

State Contract Number (e.g., PC12345) PC67290

Federal Employer Identification Number / FEIN (e.g. 14-1234567) 16-1609363

NYS Vendor ID Number (e.g., 1000012345) 1000008473

Primary Contact Information

Mini-Bid Request Number from Form A (Class 3-8): Mini-Bid
Request (e.g. T15060001)

T18080022

Group 40500-22904, VEHICLES, Class 3-8

Form B (Class 3-8): Mini-Bid Response (Response Summary)

See the "Instructions and Charts" worksheet for general form instructions, Delivery Region Chart and Delivery Allowance Schedule.
Cells below will be black-colored until Question 1.0 and 1.1 are answered. Complete all yellow-colored cells. Failure to enter a response
in a yellow-colored cell may result in the Mini-Bid Response being being deemed non-reponsive and in the disqualification of the Mini-
Bid response.

Part A: Mini-Bid and Contractor Information
Question Contractor Response

Award 22904 Contract Template Form B (Class 3-8) Mini-Bid Response ; Response Summary Page 4 of 7



GROUP 40500-22904 VEHICLES, Class 3-8 (Statewide) Appendix C: #5

Item
Chassis
Model
Year

Chassis Make Chassis Model
Chassis
Model
Code

Total # of
Chassis

NYS
Chassis
Discount

NYS Contract
Price
(Chassis)

Total NYS
Contract
Price
(Chassis)

Body
Model
Year

Body Make Body Model Body Model
Code

Total #
of
Bodies

NYS
Contract
Price (Body)

Total NYS
Contract
Price
(Bodies)

Total
Delivery
Charge for
Vehicles

Total
Evaluation
Price for Item

Item 1 2019 Ford F-550 XL
SUPERCAB

X5H 1 19.70 $51,022.62 $51,022.62 2019 READING CLASSIC II
SERIES

1 $14,125.00 $14,125.00 $362.00 $65,509.62

Item 2
Item 3
Item 4
Item 5
Item 6
Item 7
Item 8
Item 9
Item 10
Item 11
Item 12

$65,509.62

Form Version 12/07/2017

Part B: Mini-Bid Response Summary  shall be automatically populated, based on Contractor input on the "Item" worksheets.  Cells in each Item Row will be black-colored until a number of Items is indicated in Question 1.1
above. After a number of Items is selected, the corresponding Rows will be unhidden. IF "Enter Pricing" appears in a Row for an Item, that indicates that the pricing for that Vehicle (Chassis, Body, and/or Delivery Charge) on the
applicable "Item" worksheet has not been completed by the Contractor. In order to submit a responsive Mini-Bid response, all requested information for all Items included in the Mini-Bid should be entered on the applicable "Item"
worksheet.

If "Enter Pricing" appears in the "Grand Total Evaluation Price for Mini-Bid" cell (Cell S39), that indicates that all required pricing information has not been entered by the Contractor on the applicable "Item" worksheet. Failure to
enter all required pricing information for an Item shall deem the Mini-Bid response for that Item non-responsive and shall result in the rejection of the Mini-Bid response for the Mini-Bid.

Grand Total Evaluation Price for Mini-Bid
(the dollar amount used to evaluate the Mini-Bid):

Award 22904 Contract Template Form B (Class 3-8) Mini-Bid Response ; Response Summary Page 5 of 7



GROUP 40500-22904 VEHICLES, Class 3-8 (Statewide) Appendix C: #5

Q#
1.0

1.1

2.0
2.1

2.1

2.3

2.4

3.0
3.1

3.2

3.3

3.4

4.0
4.1

4.2

4.3

4.4 Contact Phone (2) 518-692-2246

Part B: Mini-Bid Response Summary

Contact Phone (1) 518-390-0041

Contact Email mark@carmodyford.com
Contact Phone (1) 518-621-4135

Contact Phone (2) 518-692-2246

Secondary Contact Information
Contact Name John Carmody

Contact Email jccarmodyford@gmail.com

Contact Name Mark Robillard

Number of Items included in this Mini-Bid (see Form A (Class 3-8):
Mini-Bid Request for number of Items, click on yellow cell and use drop-
down menu)

1

Business Information
Full Legal Business Name, including DBA if applicable Carmody Ford Inc

State Contract Number (e.g., PC12345) PC67991

Federal Employer Identification Number / FEIN (e.g. 14-1234567) 14-1458192

NYS Vendor ID Number (e.g., 1000012345) 1000006713

Primary Contact Information

Mini-Bid Request Number from Form A (Class 3-8): Mini-Bid
Request (e.g. T15060001)

T18080022

Group 40500-22904, VEHICLES, Class 3-8

Form B (Class 3-8): Mini-Bid Response (Response Summary)

See the "Instructions and Charts" worksheet for general form instructions, Delivery Region Chart and Delivery Allowance Schedule.
Cells below will be black-colored until Question 1.0 and 1.1 are answered. Complete all yellow-colored cells. Failure to enter a response
in a yellow-colored cell may result in the Mini-Bid Response being being deemed non-reponsive and in the disqualification of the Mini-
Bid response.

Part A: Mini-Bid and Contractor Information
Question Contractor Response

Award 22904 Contract Template Form B (Class 3-8) Mini-Bid Response ; Response Summary Page 6 of 7



GROUP 40500-22904 VEHICLES, Class 3-8 (Statewide) Appendix C: #5

Item
Chassis
Model
Year

Chassis Make Chassis Model
Chassis
Model
Code

Total # of
Chassis

NYS
Chassis
Discount

NYS Contract
Price
(Chassis)

Total NYS
Contract
Price
(Chassis)

Body
Model
Year

Body Make Body Model Body Model
Code

Total #
of
Bodies

NYS
Contract
Price (Body)

Total NYS
Contract
Price
(Bodies)

Total
Delivery
Charge for
Vehicles

Total
Evaluation
Price for Item

Item 1 2019 Ford F-550 Super Cab
XL

X5H 1 14.25 $53,988.20 $53,988.20 2019 Reading
Classic II

U132A-dw 1 $12,660.00 $12,660.00 $175.00 $66,823.20

Item 2
Item 3
Item 4
Item 5
Item 6
Item 7
Item 8
Item 9
Item 10
Item 11
Item 12

$66,823.20

Form Version 12/07/2017

Part B: Mini-Bid Response Summary  shall be automatically populated, based on Contractor input on the "Item" worksheets.  Cells in each Item Row will be black-colored until a number of Items is indicated in Question 1.1
above. After a number of Items is selected, the corresponding Rows will be unhidden. IF "Enter Pricing" appears in a Row for an Item, that indicates that the pricing for that Vehicle (Chassis, Body, and/or Delivery Charge) on the
applicable "Item" worksheet has not been completed by the Contractor. In order to submit a responsive Mini-Bid response, all requested information for all Items included in the Mini-Bid should be entered on the applicable "Item"
worksheet.

If "Enter Pricing" appears in the "Grand Total Evaluation Price for Mini-Bid" cell (Cell S39), that indicates that all required pricing information has not been entered by the Contractor on the applicable "Item" worksheet. Failure to
enter all required pricing information for an Item shall deem the Mini-Bid response for that Item non-responsive and shall result in the rejection of the Mini-Bid response for the Mini-Bid.

Grand Total Evaluation Price for Mini-Bid
(the dollar amount used to evaluate the Mini-Bid):

Award 22904 Contract Template Form B (Class 3-8) Mini-Bid Response ; Response Summary Page 7 of 7
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Town of Orangetown Sewer District #2 

Heavy Duty Utility Body Truck 

Chassis Specification 
2018 Ford F-550 Chassis Cab XL SuperCab, 192” Wheelbase, 7L 4 Valve OHV Power Stroke V8 Turbo Disel 
B20 Engine, 6 Speed Automatic with SelectShift® Transmission (6R140), 4X4, 4.88 Limited Slip Axle, 
DRW, Painted Electric Orange or similar. 

 XL Value Package 

 Power Equipment Group 

 Trailer Tow Package—High Capacity 

 Payload Plus Upgrade Package (19,500 Lb. GVRW) 

 Extra heavy-Duty Front End Suspension 

 Remote Start System 

 Exterior Backup Alarm 

 Alternators—Dual Extra Heavy Duty 

 Center High-Mounted Stop Lamp (CHMSL) 

 Utility Lighting System 

 Manually Telescoping/Folding Trailer Tow with Power/Heated Glass. Heated Convex Spotter 

Mirror. Integrated Clearance Lamps/Turn Signals 

 Platform Running Boards 

 19.5—Inch Argent Painted Steel Wheels (DRW) 

 225/70Rx19.5G BSW Max Traction 4x4  Tires 

 Spare Tire, Wheel and Jack 

 Wheel Well Liners—Front 

 Medium Earth Gray Vinyl 

 Carpet Delete 

 Operator Commanded Regeneration 

 Integrated Trailer Brake Controller 

 Rapid-Heat Supplemental Cab Heater 

 110V/400W outlet 

 Upfitter Interface Module 

 AM/FM Stereo Single-CD/MP3 Player 

 SYNC 

 HD Vinyl 40/20/40 Split Bench Front Seats 

 Extended Diesel Engine Warranty 

 Extended Drivetrain Warranty 
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  Tel: (845) 359-6502 
Town of Orangetown Department of Environmental Management and Engineering Fax: (845) 359-6951 
 

 

Body Specification 

Body to be: 

 Reading Classic II Service Body 132 Series 

 Compartment Lighting System 

 Dual Wheel recessed bumper with L.E.D. Lights.   

 Removable Side Mount Ladder Rack—Flat Mount 

Model and Configuration to be: 

Model # 
Approx 
Weight 

Cab-
To-
Axle 

Approximate Clear Door Openings 

USR132AB-DW 
1831 
LBS. 

84” 22½“x35¼” 48¼”x14” 20¾”x35¼” 72½”x14” 20¾”x18⅛” 35”x35¼” 11½”x35¼” 
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Michael Weber

From: Josh Relyea <jrelyea@vanbortelford.com>
Sent: Thursday, September 13, 2018 2:32 PM
To: Michael Weber
Subject: RE: Mini-Bid #18080170 Dealer Invoice and OEM Specifications
Attachments: 27936 Mini Bid 18080170.pdf

Please review:

Note that we just received this communication from Ford today at 11:52am:
“2019 MY Police Interceptor (PI) Utility - Balance Out

 A balance-out message has been entered in CONCEPS for the 2019 MY PI Utility as of Thursday, September 13, 2018.

 The order rate over the past few weeks has been more than double the normal order rate and has resulted in more
orders than available for the 2019 MY PI Utility production allocation.

 CONCEPS will accept orders through Friday September 21, 2019 which is the published final order due date (FODD).
However, orders placed on or after September 13, 2018 will most likely not be scheduled for production.

 The Government Sales Team will be reviewing the unscheduled order bank over the next few weeks. If your orders will
not be scheduled a member of the team will be contacting dealers directly. “

Josh Relyea
Fleet Department Manager
Van Bortel Fleet Dept.
P - 585-586-7705

From: Michael Weber [mailto:mweber@orangetown.com]
Sent: Thursday, September 13, 2018 1:59 PM
To: Josh Relyea <jrelyea@vanbortelford.com>
Subject: RE: Mini-Bid #18080170 Dealer Invoice and OEM Specifications

Awaiting your review and submission.

Cordially,
Michael Weber
Chief Operator
Town of Orangetown SD #2
D.E.M.E.
127 Route 303
Orangeburg, NY 10962
p:845-359-6502 ext 4205
f:845-359-6951
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From: Josh Relyea [mailto:jrelyea@vanbortelford.com]
Sent: Wednesday, September 12, 2018 3:48 PM
To: Michael Weber
Cc: Frank Peneno; Helen Chee; Jeffrey Bencik; Eamon Reilly; Maria Opaczewski; George Lunney
Subject: RE: Mini-Bid #18080170 Dealer Invoice and OEM Specifications

We have this generated and should be sending it out some point tomorrow after it’s reviewed.

Josh Relyea
Fleet Department Manager
Van Bortel Fleet Dept.
P - 585-586-7705

From: Michael Weber [mailto:mweber@orangetown.com]
Sent: Wednesday, September 12, 2018 1:32 PM
To: Josh Relyea <jrelyea@vanbortelford.com>; Ford Fleet <fleet.ford@vanbortelford.com>
Cc: Frank Peneno <fpeneno@orangetown.com>; Helen Chee <hchee@orangetown.com>; Jeffrey Bencik
<jbencik@orangetown.com>; Eamon Reilly <ereilly@orangetown.com>
Subject: Mini-Bid #18080170 Dealer Invoice and OEM Specifications

Hello,

Thank you for bidding on our recent request for 2019 Ford Interceptor as specified in Mini-bid #18080170. Pursuant to
the recommendations from OGS, please provide a dealer invoice and a detailed OEM Specification for the vehicle
described in the request. The town has elected to make a purchase of 2 vehicles of the same specification at this
time. Please provide invoices that are representative.

Thank you.

Cordially,
Michael Weber
Chief Operator
Town of Orangetown SD #2
D.E.M.E.
127 Route 303
Orangeburg, NY 10962
p:845-359-6502 ext 4205
f:845-359-6951
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Michael Weber

From: Josh Relyea <jrelyea@vanbortelford.com>
Sent: Friday, October 05, 2018 1:04 PM
To: Michael Weber
Subject: RE: Mini-Bid #18080170 Dealer Invoice and OEM Specifications
Attachments: 2019 Expedition Order Guide.pdf; 8771-nca.pdf; Contract extension page 2019.pdf

Michael,
I have attached the order guide for you to review on the 2019 Expedition. There is currently no final order date for
them. The thing with the expeditions is they are designed for retail use and “changed” for fleet use. The SSV option
deletes the 3rd row and puts vinyl in etc. It does not make it a pursuit unit If you are in need of a pursuit unit I would
recommend either going to the Tahoe or the F150 responder unit. Or possible waiting for the 2020 Police utility model
(on the ground estimate of late summer of ’19.)

I have attached a contract that you can utilize without having to rebid.

The regular length expedition in the above attached contract base price for the 2019 SSV is about $35,750
The SSV Tahoe is $33333 and the pursuit unit is $400 more
Nice Tahoe LT is $43165

The responder 150 is right about $35K (without a cap) (still working on offering this as a substitution to the above
contract)

The 2020 utility is going to be about $31500.(gas engine) and the hybrid version is about $3k more

Josh Relyea
Fleet Department Manager
Van Bortel Fleet Dept.
P - 585-586-7705

From: Michael Weber [mailto:mweber@orangetown.com]
Sent: Friday, October 05, 2018 12:17 PM
To: Josh Relyea <jrelyea@vanbortelford.com>
Subject: RE: Mini-Bid #18080170 Dealer Invoice and OEM Specifications

Hello Josh,

I just heard that your office contacted Frank to tell him that the Interceptors were not going to be available, the two for
my department and the three from the Police Department. We are thinking that we will be leaning toward purchasing
the Expedition Police version if those will still be available. That considered, if we do create a mini-bid for the five
vehicles, three will be straight up police and two are for administrative use. Do they offer an interior upgrade package
to convert the Police Package version to an administrative vehicle? Look forward to speaking with you so that we can
properly piece together a mini-bid that will cover all of the vehicles. Thanks.
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Cordially,
Michael Weber
Chief Operator
Town of Orangetown SD #2
D.E.M.E.
127 Route 303
Orangeburg, NY 10962
p:845-359-6502 ext 4205
f:845-359-6951

From: Josh Relyea [mailto:jrelyea@vanbortelford.com]
Sent: Thursday, September 13, 2018 2:32 PM
To: Michael Weber
Subject: RE: Mini-Bid #18080170 Dealer Invoice and OEM Specifications

Please review:

Note that we just received this communication from Ford today at 11:52am:
“2019 MY Police Interceptor (PI) Utility - Balance Out

 A balance-out message has been entered in CONCEPS for the 2019 MY PI Utility as of Thursday, September 13, 2018.

 The order rate over the past few weeks has been more than double the normal order rate and has resulted in more
orders than available for the 2019 MY PI Utility production allocation.

 CONCEPS will accept orders through Friday September 21, 2019 which is the published final order due date (FODD).
However, orders placed on or after September 13, 2018 will most likely not be scheduled for production.

 The Government Sales Team will be reviewing the unscheduled order bank over the next few weeks. If your orders will
not be scheduled a member of the team will be contacting dealers directly. “

Josh Relyea
Fleet Department Manager
Van Bortel Fleet Dept.
P - 585-586-7705

From: Michael Weber [mailto:mweber@orangetown.com]
Sent: Thursday, September 13, 2018 1:59 PM
To: Josh Relyea <jrelyea@vanbortelford.com>
Subject: RE: Mini-Bid #18080170 Dealer Invoice and OEM Specifications

Awaiting your review and submission.

Cordially,
Michael Weber
Chief Operator
Town of Orangetown SD #2
D.E.M.E.
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127 Route 303
Orangeburg, NY 10962
p:845-359-6502 ext 4205
f:845-359-6951

From: Josh Relyea [mailto:jrelyea@vanbortelford.com]
Sent: Wednesday, September 12, 2018 3:48 PM
To: Michael Weber
Cc: Frank Peneno; Helen Chee; Jeffrey Bencik; Eamon Reilly; Maria Opaczewski; George Lunney
Subject: RE: Mini-Bid #18080170 Dealer Invoice and OEM Specifications

We have this generated and should be sending it out some point tomorrow after it’s reviewed.

Josh Relyea
Fleet Department Manager
Van Bortel Fleet Dept.
P - 585-586-7705

From: Michael Weber [mailto:mweber@orangetown.com]
Sent: Wednesday, September 12, 2018 1:32 PM
To: Josh Relyea <jrelyea@vanbortelford.com>; Ford Fleet <fleet.ford@vanbortelford.com>
Cc: Frank Peneno <fpeneno@orangetown.com>; Helen Chee <hchee@orangetown.com>; Jeffrey Bencik
<jbencik@orangetown.com>; Eamon Reilly <ereilly@orangetown.com>
Subject: Mini-Bid #18080170 Dealer Invoice and OEM Specifications

Hello,

Thank you for bidding on our recent request for 2019 Ford Interceptor as specified in Mini-bid #18080170. Pursuant to
the recommendations from OGS, please provide a dealer invoice and a detailed OEM Specification for the vehicle
described in the request. The town has elected to make a purchase of 2 vehicles of the same specification at this
time. Please provide invoices that are representative.

Thank you.

Cordially,
Michael Weber
Chief Operator
Town of Orangetown SD #2
D.E.M.E.
127 Route 303
Orangeburg, NY 10962
p:845-359-6502 ext 4205
f:845-359-6951



 

LOCAL LAW NO.____OF 2018 OF THE                                                                            

INCORPORATED TOWN OF ORANGETOWN, NEW YORK 

TOWN BOARD TO AMEND CHAPTER 22 OF THE TOWN CODE ENTITLED 

“NOISE” 

 

BE IT ENACTED BY THE TOWN BOARD OF THE TOWN OF 

ORANGETOWN AS FOLLOWS:  

As amended, Additions are underlined, Deletions are stricken.  Chapter 22-Noise,  

originally adopted by the Town Board on 08/17/1981 by LL No. 10-1981, is hereby 

amended as follows:  

 

Section 1. 

 

§ 22-2 Excessive Unnecessary noise prohibited.  
 

A. It shall be unlawful for any person to make, continue or cause or permit to be made or 

continued any unnecessary noise unnecessary, unusually loud, or unusually disturbing 

noise within the limits of the Town. 

B. “Unnecessary noise” means any excessive or unusually loud sound or any sound 

which either annoys, disturbs, injures or endangers the comfort, repose, health, peace 

or safety of a reasonable person of normal sensibilities, or which causes injury to 

animal life or damage to property or business. Standards to be considered in 

determining whether unnecessary noise exists in a given situation, include but are not 

limited to the following: 

1 The intensity of the noise 

2.Whether the nature of the noise is usual or unusual 

3.Whether the origin of the noise is natural or unnatural 

4.The intensity of the background noise 

5.The proximity of the noise to sleeping facilities 

6 The nature and the zoning district of the area within which the noise emanates 

7 The time of the day or night the noise occurs 

8.The duration of the noise 

9.Whether the sound source is temporary 

10.Whether the noise is continuous or intermittent 

11.Whether alternate methods are available to achieve the objectives of the sound 

producing activity. 

 

 

 

 

 



 

§ 22-3 Prohibited noises General Prohibition.  

The following acts are declared to be excessive, unusually loud, unusually disturbing and 

unnecessary noises in violation of the local law. 

A. Horns, signaling devices, etc. The sounding of any horn or signaling device on any 

automobile, motorcycle or other vehicle on any street or public place of the Town of 

Orangetown, except as a danger warning; the sounding of any such device for an 

unnecessary and unreasonable period of time; and the use of any such signaling device 

when traffic is for any reason held up.  

B. Television sets, reproduced music and audio, bands, etc. The playing, using, operating 

or permitting to be played, used or operated of any television set, musical instrument, 

band, music or audio playback device or other machine or device for the producing or 

reproducing of sound in such manner as to disturb the peace, quiet, tranquility and 

comfort of the neighboring inhabitants or at any time with louder volume than is 

necessary for the convenient hearing of the person or persons who are in the place, 

room, vehicle or chamber in which such set, machine, instrument, band or device is 

payed or operated and who are voluntary listeners thereto.  The playing or operation 

of any such set, tape recorder, instrument, band, phonograph, machine or device 

between the hours of 11:00 p.m. and 7:00 a.m. in such manner as to be plainly audible 

ata distance of 50 feet from the place, building,  

C. Loudspeakers and amplifiers for advertising. The playing, using, operating or 

permitting to be played, used or operated of any radio receiving set, television set, 

musical instrument, band, tape recorder, phonograph, loudspeaker, sound amplifier, or 

other machine or device for the purpose of producing or reproducing of sound which 

is placed upon the public streets for the purpose of commercial advertising or 

attracting the attention of the public to any building or structure.  

D. Yelling and shouting. Yelling and shouting on the public streets between the hours of 

11:00 p.m. and 7:00 a.m. or at any other time or at any other place so as to annoy or 

disturb the quiet, comfort or repose of persons in any office or in any dwelling, hotel 

or other type of residence or of any persons in the vicinity.  

E. Animals.  The keeping of any dog or other animal which, by causing frequent or long 

or continued barking or other noise, shall disturb the comfort or repose of any persons 

in the vicinity. 

F. Schools, courts, churches and hospitals. The creation of any excessive noise on any 

street adjacent to any school, institution of learning, church or court while the same 

are in use, or adjacent to any hospital, which noise unreasonably interferes with the 

workings of such institution, or which noise disturbs or unduly annoys patients in the 

hospital, provided that conspicuous signs are displayed in such streets indicating that 

the same is a school, hospital or court street.  

G. Hawkers and peddlers. The shouting, yelling and crying of peddlers, hawkers and 



vendors which disturbs the peace and quiet of the neighborhood. 

No person shall make, continue or cause or permit to be made any unnecessary noise 

that annoys, disturbs, injures or endangers the comfort, repose, health, peace or safety of a 

reasonable person of normal sensibilities, or which causes injury or damage to property or 

business in accordance with the standards set forth in §22-2(B).  

The following acts are declared to be prima facie evidence of a violation of this 

article and are prohibited, but said enumeration shall not be deemed to be exclusive. 

A. The sounding of any horn or signaling device on any automobile, motorcycle or other 

vehicle on any street or public place of the Town of Orangetown, except as a danger 

warning.  

B. The playing, using, operating or permitting to be played, used or operated of any 

television set, musical instrument, band, music or audio playback device or other 

machine or device for the producing or reproducing of sound, loudspeaker, sound 

amplifier, in such manner as to disturb the peace, quiet, tranquility and comfort of the 

neighboring inhabitants or the public at large, as follows: 

i. Between the hours of 7:00 a.m. and 11:00 p.m, that has a volume of 80 decibels or 

greater at the point of alleged disturbance if at a distance of less than 50 feet , or 70 

decibels or greater at the point of alleged disturbance  if at a distance of 50 feet or 

more, from the property line of the property of the noise source, or from the place, 

device, or vehicle if on the public streets, in which it is located; or 

ii. Between the hours of 11:00 p.m.  and 7:00 a.m, that has a volume of 60 decibels or 

greater at the point  of alleged disturbance if at a distance of less than 50 feet, or 40 

decibels or greater at the point  of alleged disturbance if at a distance of 50 feet or 

more, from the property line of the property of the noise source, or from the place, 

device, or vehicle if on the public streets, in which it is located. 

C. The keeping of any dog or animal which: 

i. Engages in frequent or long continued barking, howling or other noise at 60 decibels 

or greater  at or beyond the property line of the property of the noise source, or from 

the place, device, or vehicle if on the public streets, such that said noise is:  

ii. Between the hours of 10:00 p.m. and 8:00 a.m. of a duration longer than 10 

consecutive minutes, and disturbs the comfort or repose of any persons in the vicinity; 

or  

iii. Between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 10:00 p.m of a duration of more than one hour, 

and disturbs the comfort or repose of any persons in the vicinity. 

D. Noise at or above the level of 60 decibels at the point of alleged disturbance on any 

street adjacent to any school, institution of learning, church or court while the same 

are in use, or adjacent to any hospital, which noise unreasonably interferes with the 

workings of such institution, or which noise disturbs or unduly annoys patients in the 

hospital, provided that conspicuous signs are displayed in such streets indicating that 



the same is a school, hospital or court street. 

E. Any other noise at a level at or above 80 decibels at the point of alleged disturbance 

between the hours of 7:00 a.m. and 11:00 p.m., which point must be at or beyond the 

property line of the property of the noise source if the source is located on private 

property. 

F. Any other noise at a level at or above 50 decibels at the point of alleged disturbance 

between the hours of 11:00 p.m. and 8:00 a.m., which point must be at or beyond the 

property line of the property of the noise source if the source is located on private 

property. 

G.  Any sound caused by the operation of any lawn mower, leaf blower, chain saw, hedge 

clipper, mulching or chipping machine or such similar landscaping equipment prior to 

7:00 a.m. and after 8:00 p.m. on Monday through Friday; prior to 8:00 a.m. and after 

7:00 p.m. on Saturday; and prior to 9:00 a.m. and after 7:00 p.m. on a Sunday or legal 

holiday. 

H. Any sound of any bulldozer, backhoe or other excavation or earthmoving equipment 

prior to 7:00 a.m. and after 8:00 p.m. on Monday through Friday; prior to 8:00 a.m. 

and after 7:00 p.m. on Saturday, and prior to 9:00 a.m. and after 7:00 p.m. on a Sunday 

or legal holiday. 

I. The sound of any power tool, machinery or equipment in use in any construction 

project or the repair of any building or in any commercial activity or manufacturing 

process not wholly contained within a closed structure,  

1. in any zone other than a residential zone, prior to 7:00 a.m. or after 8:00 p.m.; 

2.   in any residential zone, prior to 7:00 a.m. and after 8:00 p.m. on Monday 

through Friday, prior to 8:00 a.m. and after 7:00 p.m. on Saturday, and prior to 

9:00 a.m. and after 5:00 p.m. on a Sunday or legal holiday. 

22-3A Exemptions.  

The following activities shall be exempt from the provisions of this code:  

1. Operation of snow blowers or other snow removal equipment at any time during or 

within 48 hours of the conclusion of a snowfall; 

2. Work or activity that is necessary to prevent or recover from an emergency, 

including, but not limited to, work to repair electric, gas, water, sewer or telephone 

services. For purposes of this article an “emergency” shall mean a public calamity, 

disaster, extreme weather event, utility services failure, or such other threat to any 

person or property to actual or immediate danger. 

3. The sound produced by any siren, alarm or other warning device operated by any 

ambulance service, police or fire department or any governmental agency when 

intended to warn the public of any danger or emergency. 



4. Public meeting; parades or processions as permitted by Chapter 7A of this code; 

       5. The emission of sound by generators during emergencies. 

      6. Sounds connected with organized sporting events on public property or public or        

private school property, held between the hours of 8:00 a.m. and 10:00 p.m.   

§ 22-4 Penalties for offenses.  

Any person violating any of the provisions of this local law shall be deemed guilty of a 

violation and, upon conviction thereof, shall be fined in an amount not exceeding $250 or 

be imprisoned for a period not exceeding 15 days or to perform up to 50 hours of 

community service, or by any combination of said penalties 10 days, or by both such fine 

and imprisonment. 

 

§ 22-5 Additional remedies.  
 

As an additional remedy, the operation or maintenance of any device, instrument, vehicle 

or machinery or activities conducted at a property in such manner so as to constitute a 

violation of any provision hereof which continually, regularly or repeatedly causes such 

violation, and which causes discomfort or annoyance to reasonable persons of normal 

sensitiveness or which endangers the comfort, repose, health or peace of residents in the 

area shall be deemed and is declared to be a public nuisance and may be subject to 

abatement summarily by a restraining order or injunction issued by a court of competent 

jurisdiction. 

§ 22-5A Enforcement.  

The provisions of this chapter shall be enforced by the Police Department of the Town of 

Orangetown, the Town of Orangetown Office of Building Planning Zoning Administration 

and Enforcement, or such other officials as designated by the Town Board. 

 

Section 2. Severability Clause 

The invalidity of any word, section, clause, paragraph, sentence, part or provision 

of this local law shall not affect the validity of any other part of this local law that can be 

given effect without such invalid parts. 

 

Section 3. Effective Date. 

 This Local Law shall become effective immediately upon being filed with the 

Secretary of State.  

 



Date of Expenditure Scope of Work Amount Paid by OMM

04/26/2017 Fencing 5,289.67

08/01/2017 Fencing 4,200.00

04/12/2017 Flagpoles 8,900.00

04/22/2017 Flagpoles 13,064.00

06/22/2017 Flagpoles 4,203.89

09/30/2017 Flagpoles 13,065.00

01/05/2017 Lights 27,562.50

02/16/2017 Lights 1,550.00

03/02/2017 Lights 62,000.00

03/09/2017 Lights 19,682.70

07/14/2017 Lights 1,550.00

12/27/2017 Storage Container 6,080.00

04/13/2017 Turf 4,200.00

04/17/2017 Turf 7,210.00

04/17/2017 Turf 60,850.00

07/21/2017 Turf 1,750.00

07/27/2017 Turf 100,000.00

07/31/2017 Turf 100,000.00

08/01/2017 Turf 79,910.00

08/07/2017 Turf 7,584.00

08/17/2017 Turf 15,500.00

08/22/2017 Turf 10,400.00

09/13/2017 Turf 100,000.00

09/13/2017 Turf 100,000.00

09/13/2017 Turf 60,850.00

09/15/2017 Turf 34,320.00

09/15/2017 Turf 16,125.00

09/15/2017 Turf 14,325.00

880,171.76

OMM Soccer
2017 Capital Improvements to Be Gifted to Town

Installation of New Turf Fields (Field 2, 3, 4), Upgrade of Lighting, Installation of New 
Fencing, Installation of Flagpoles & New Shipping Containers for Storage

 Page 1 of 1
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Consulting Services Agreement

This agreement is effective as of                                       , 2018  between Goldkap Consulting Group, LLC 
(“Consultant”) having an address at 57 Lafayette Avenue, Suffern, NY 10901 and Town of Orangetown 
(“Client”) located at 26 Orangeburg Road, Orangeburg, NY 10962

The client and consultant agree to as follows:

1. The client retains consultant to assist client in the areas detailed below.
2. Consultant Services. During the terms of this agreement, in connection with the project, the 

consultant will work on behalf of the client at all times in areas outlined. 

The consultant shall:

a. Exploring ways that town inventory can be better managed and putting together a fixed asset 
report to better track equipment going in and out of departments.

b. Work with department heads to explore ways where using new vendors will make departments 
more efficient and less dependent on labor.

c. Work with IT department to discuss how payroll processing and other technology platforms can 
be integrated into a planned future approach to build less labor-intensive solutions.

d. Assist with department heads in negotiating with vendors as it pertains to getting the best value 
for services and not overpaying for change orders on present contracts.

e. Verify the way present procurement processes are being used and set-up on line vendor 
ordering with approval processes in place.

3. Client Role. The client agrees to cooperate with consultant and make available on a timely basis 
all relevant information and documents deemed necessary to make consultant successful.

4. Compensation. The client agrees to pay consultant as follows:
a. One-hundred seventy-five ($175.00) per hour for services rendered for all work done on behalf 

of the project as outlined in paragraph 2 not to exceed $5,250.00(30 hours) without an 
addendum and written scope of work approved by supervisor. 

b. 50% due upon signing. 
c. Terms thereafter are net 30 days from receipt of report submission for remaining balance.  

5. Expenses. Consultant will be reimbursed within seven(7) business days of submission to client 
for out- of-pocket expenses, including but not limited to postage, reproductions, and fees paid 
that were directly attributable to the project(s). 

6. Outside Services. Outside services including, but not limited to advertising, legal fees, job 
posting fees and recruitment fees are the responsibility of the client and will be billed directly to 
the client. No outside service fees will be contracted without the approval of client.

7. Travel. Travel fees will be waived in Rockland and Westchester County. General auto travel fees 
will be charged to client at $.59/mile plus tolls.
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8. Suspension. If the client fails to make timely payments to the consultant for services or 
expenses, consultant may, upon seven (7) days written notice to the client, suspend 
performance of services under this agreement. In the event of suspension of services, 
consultant shall have no liability to the client for delay or damage caused the client because of 
such suspension of services.  

9. Opt out clause. Client, or consultant, after work and completed payment, can suspend this 
agreement without cause upon seven (7) days written notice to other party or enter into 
additional or new agreement. All documentation under this agreement and any information 
relating to this project will be available to client if opt out clause is exercised.

10. Independent Contractor. The consultant shall render services hereunder as an independent 
contractor. Nothing in this shall establish any employer-employee relationship between the 
consultant, any agent, or any employee of the consultant or client. Consultant shall receive no 
benefits for pension, health or other insurance plans, employee benefits, or any benefit of 
whatever nature offered by client to its employees. Subject to the provisions in carrying out this 
agreement, the consultant is solely responsible for hours worked and the place where services 
are rendered.

11. Tax. Client shall not be responsible for withholding Social Security (FICA) tax or any other tax 
from payments made to the consultant and shall not withhold State, Local and Federal tax 
payments from consultant compensation.  Consultant   shall complete the appropriate form(s) 
provided by client in order to facilitate form 1099 reporting.

12. Confidentiality and Proprietary Information. Consultant acknowledges and agrees that in 
connection to the services rendered under this agreement, consultant shall have access to 
proprietary information from client of a nature not generally disclosed to the public 
(“Confidential Information”). Confidential information includes but not limited to drafts of the 
business plan, client business and strategies, customer lists and other documentation, data and 
materials developed by the consultant in the course of providing its services for client.  
Consultant understands that such information is owned and shall continue to be owned solely 
by client. Consultant agrees to keep confidential and not to disclose confidential information to 
anyone except those directly involved with the project.  Consultant represents that it and its 
business affiliates, employees, officers, agents, personal representatives, salespersons or any 
other person that it may employ, hire or retain in the performance of this agreement have 
complied with and will comply with this commitment during and after his/her, or their 
employment. Upon completion of the project, consultant agrees to return any original records 
containing such confidential information.

13. Entire agreement. This agreement contains the entire understanding between the parties 
concerning the project. Consultant acknowledges that no representations or statements have 
been made which would modify or tend to modify any provisions of this agreement.

14. Choice of Law, Venue. This agreement shall be construed, interpreted, and governed by the 
laws of the State of New York, and the venues of any action shall be Rockland County.

15. Notices. Except as otherwise set forth herein, any and all notices required under the terms of 
this agreement shall be in writing and sent by hand delivery, fax or by certified mail, return 
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receipt requested. Unless otherwise designated in writing, notices shall be addressed to the 
parties at the addresses set forth at the beginning of this agreement.

16. Authority. The parties acknowledge that the signatories are vested with the authority to 
execute this agreement on behalf of their respective parties.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF: The parties hereto have caused this agreement to be executed as of the date 
and year first set forth.

Town of Orangetown

By:_____________________________

Print Name_______________________

Date_________________

 

Goldkap Consulting Group, LLC

By:_________________________________

Print Name___________________________

Date____________________
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Rocklands Tobacco Control

1. Rockland included vaping in their Clean Indoor Air Act.
2. Rockland increased the age to purchase tobacco products (Vaping included) to 21
3. Rockland County owned parks prohibit smoking and vaping.
4. Rockland County passed a disclosure law for multi-unit housing. Smoking restriction 

must be in the lease.
5. Rockland County was the first in NYS to ban tobacco products in pharmacies.
6. Rockland County passed a law prohibiting smoking in cars with anyone under the age of 

18.
7. Rockland County playgrounds are smoke free.

What can we do to make things better? What can we do to help smokers quit and 
protect our youth from starting?
We can work together to bring awareness to tobacco issues and find solutions.

1. Prohibit smoking and vaping in public outdoor spaces, parks, pools, Village and Town 
Halls.

2. More smoke free multi-unit housing.
3. Restrict the number of tobacco retailers.
4. Implement a County tobacco tax in addition to the NYS tax.
5. Tobacco retailers need to be 1,000 feet from schools.
6. Prohibit tobacco coupons and  multi pack discounts .

Survey results:

1. 80.8% favor a policy that would restrict smoking in worksite entryways.
2. 61.4% favor a policy that would prevent retailers from offering multi-pack discounts on 

cigarettes.
3. 70.7% favor a policy that would prohibit the display of tobacco products, so they are 

out of view of customers.
4. 62% favor a policy that would prohibit retailers from excepting tobacco coupons.
5. 62% favor a policy that would limit the number of stores that sell tobacco.
6. 72% favor a policy that prohibit the sale of tobacco products located near schools.

Rockland County has always been the lead in Tobacco Control and our survey shows 
that the residents are in favor of restricting tobacco. 





























































Quotation  by St. Croix Sensory, Inc.

Company: Town of Orangetown Quotation (RMA) No: 18295141

Attn: Jane Slavin Date Issued: 10.22.18

Address: 20 Greenbush Road

City, State: Orangeburg, NY 10962

Tel: (845)359-8410 x4302

E-mail jslavin@orangetown.com

Service/Product Description Qty Rate Total

Nasal Ranger® Field Olfactometer (P/N: NR0001)         

Package includes: (1) 1-NR, 4-Odor Filter Cartridges, 1-

Mask w/Check Valves and Comfort Seal, 10-Comfort 

Seals, 10-Mask Wipes, 1-Shoulder Strap, 1-Carrying 

Bag, 4-Mask O-rings, 1-Barrel Brush, 1-Operations 

Manual; (2) 1-NR Training Access Code; (3) Odor 

Track'r 6 mo Subscription.            UPS Ground 

Shipping Included within US

1 $2,750.00 $2,750.00

Prepared by: Marny Stebbins

All prices in U.S. Dollars

Terms: Net 30

Comments:

A service charge of 1.5% per month, 18% APR, will be added to balances over 60 days old.  Please read the Laboratory Services Terms & Conditions .

Quote good for 60 days & Confidential

$2,750.00

7% discount off laboratory evaluations if payment is made by credit card at time of order.

St. Croix Sensory, Inc.   1150 Stillwater Blvd N.  Stillwater, MN 55042 U.S.A.   Tel:800-879-9231   Fax:651-439-1065

Email:stcroix@fivesenses.com   Web:www.fivesenses.com
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